
 

Project: UC Berkeley CMS Tenant Improvements
R&S No: 103222000
UCB No. 12641A
Trade: Wood and ACT Ceiling
Bid Pkg #: 1D
Bid Date: September 19, 21014
Time 2:00 p.m .
Format Blind Bid Opening
Base Bid Estimate: $111,000 Non Responsive

A B C D

 AD IN INC DALEYS DRYWALL AND 
TAPING INC

PERFORMANCE 
CONTRACTING INC

SPACETONE ACOUSTICS 
INC

1.0 Base Bid - Executive Education 85,528                         84,751                         106,313                       95,441                         

2.0 Alternates
2.1 Operations 1,730.00                      2,300.00                      1,898.00                      1,176.00                      
2.2 Visitors Center no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.3 Law School Option A 14,025.00                    no bid 19,083.00                    20,677.00                    
2.4 ASUC Store no bid no bid no bid no bid
2.5 Visitors Services 8,042.00                      6,187.00                      8,923.00                      6,221.00                      
2.6 Goldman School of Public Policy 11,105.00                    8,130.00                      11,551.00                    9,671.00                      

TOTAL (BASIS OF AWARD - BASE BID ITEM 1.0) 85,528                    84,751                    106,313                  95,441                    
CC: Dan Ardzrooni - UCB Martha Mendoza - UCB Mark Kobey - R&S Mike DeTata - R&S

Brian Main - UCB John Abraham - R&S Gary Taylor - R&S
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